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ITEM 7 REVIEW OF ORGANISATIONAL STRUCTURE 
  

This report presents the existing organisational structure for reaffirmation, to allow recruitment of two 
vacant positions and to meet legislative requirements. As part of strategy development early in the new 
year the Council can consider whether there is a case for an adjustment to the structure at divisional 
level.   
 

RECOMMENDATION 

1 The existing Organisational Structure be reaffirmed. 

2 Recruitment action be commenced for the vacant positions of Director Corporate Services and 
Director Community Services. 

 

REPORT AUTHORISATIONS 

Authorised by: David Farmer, General Manager  

ATTACHMENTS 

1  Current Organisational Structure for Confirmation 
2  Report to Council 26 June 2017 - Change to Organisational Structure Pending Review by Incoming 

Council 
  
 

BACKGROUND 

On 26 June 2017 Council endorsed an adjusted organisational structure to move from a three Director 
structure to a four Director structure. Given the proximity to the September 2017 election it was decided 
to not make long term appointments to the two vacant positions but to fill them on an acting basis until 
the incoming Council could consider the matter.  

The resolution of Council is shown below: 

“A change in the Organisational Structure be made by removing the role of Director Corporate and 
Community Services and creating the roles of Director Community Services and Director Corporate 
Services.  

The Director Community Services and Director Corporate Services be determined as Senior Staff 
positions in accordance with section 332 of the Local Government Act 1993. 

The two new Director roles be filled internally in an acting capacity until the structure is formally reviewed 
by the incoming Council in accordance with legislative requirements.” 

Over the past few months this structure has worked well and addressed the issues that were identified in 
the June report.  

The acting arrangements have been successful to date and have given a number of staff across the 
organisation an opportunity to perform different and more senior roles. However, after an extended 
period there is a need for some certainty and there would be benefit in having staff in longer term roles. 

A survey of staff with supervisory roles was conducted in August and comments overwhelmingly 
supported the four Director structure. A typical comment was “The 4 tier executive structure provides a 
logical split of categorised services and provides practical groupings of divisions that are most closely 
and inextricably linked.” 

The incoming Council is about to commence a significant period of strategy development including the 
refresh of the Wollongong 2022 and development of a new Delivery Program and Operational Plan.  This 
will not be completed until June 2018. Councillors will, however, have a clearer view of the collective 
strategic direction of the Council following the second set of planning workshops which are scheduled for 
February 2018.  
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The survey also asked staff about opportunities at deeper levels in the organisation and there were a 
variety of suggestions made.  

PROPOSAL 

It is proposed that the existing structure be confirmed. This allows Council to meet its legislative 
requirements on reviewing the structure. It will also allow the two vacant positions of Director Corporate 
Services and Director Community Services to be advertised externally and it would be anticipated that 
the recruitment actions would be able to be completed by Christmas. This will allow the bedding down of 
executive leadership in the organisation early in the term of the organisation.  

As part of the organisational strategy development process early in the new year, the Council can 
consider whether the structure at Divisional Manager level meets the strategic directions of the new 
Council. Should a case for change be identified, adjustments can be made at that time via a further 
report to Council. The staff feedback already provided can be considered as part of that process. 

CONSULTATION AND COMMUNICATION 

A survey of staff with supervisory responsibility was undertaken in August of this year. This matter was 
discussed with Councillors at the briefing session of 16 October 2017. 

PLANNING AND POLICY IMPACT 

The Local Government Act (s333) requires that a Council review its structure within 12 months of an 
election, the consideration of this report meets this legislative requirement.  Council can reconsider the 
structure at any time. 

This report contributes to the delivery of Wollongong 2022 goal “We are a connected and engaged 
community”.  It specifically delivers on the following:  

Community Strategic Plan Delivery Program 2012-2017 

Strategy 5 Year Action 

4.4 Our local Council has the trust of 
our community 

4.4.1 Continue to build a 
professional, customer 
focused quality 
organisation 

FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS 

The changes that were introduced by Council in late June will be included in the September 2017 
Quarterly Review. Council continues to perform better than budget and it is anticipated that there will be 
no impact of the bottom line as a result of these changes.  

CONCLUSION 

Given the successful implementation of the revised executive structure since June it is recommended 
that this be confirmed and we move to recruit the two vacant Director positions. Council can consider 
any structural change at a Divisional level as part of its strategy development process early in the new 
year.  
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